
















TO: 

CC: 

FROM: 
DATE: 
RE: 

MEMO 
Select Board 

Alicia Griffin, Finance Director and Matt Scruton, Town Administrator 
Kimberly Reed, CFM 

December 5, 2205 

Encumber 

Attached, please find a signed contract by the Rockingham Planning Commission (RPC) and the Town of 
Rye for the Rye Planning Board Circuit Rider position. RPC has a fiscal year of July 1 to June 30th 

therefore, I request to encumber funds to cover the contract from January 1, 2026 to June 30, 2026. 

Attached is an email from Jenn Rowden, RPC describing the amount spent to date and remainder of the 
contract. 

With the attached materials and information, I wish to encumber $21,828.00 01-4191-11-465. 
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Planning & Zoning Administrator 













Outlook 

Re: 2026 Budget Prep & Guidelines - Rye Historic District Commission (HOC) 

From Kaitlyn Coffey <kaitlyn.m.coffey@gmail.com> 

Date Mon 10/13/2025 4:21 PM 

To Alicia Griffin <agriffin@town.rye.nh.us> 

Cc Matt Scruton < mscruton@town.rye.nh.us>; Kara Campbell < kcampbell@town.rye.nh.us> 

� 1 attachment (65 KB) 

Estimate_ 11560_from_Timberline_Signs.pdf; 

Caution: External (kaitlyn.m.coffey@gmail.com) 

First-Time Sender Details 

Hi Alicia, 

ReRort This Email FAQ Skout Email Protection 

I just wanted to check in and let you know I received the budget request for the coming year. The 
HDC just started working on a sign maintenance project that is still in it's early stages but we did 
obtain a quote. I wasn't able to get the budget sheet to open but we would like to include this quote 
in our budget. There are a few line items that we thought the Town might be responsible for and 
those are items #3 and #4 because it involved signage at the Annex. Also the Rye Heritage is taking 
care of item #2. 

Please let me know if you have any questions or need anything else from me. 

Thank you, 
Kaitlyn 

On Wed, Oct 1, 2025 at 11 :01 AM Alicia Griffin <ggriffin@town.rY.e.nh.us> wrote: 
Commissions & Committees, 

Please see the attached memo and supporting attachments related to the 2026 Budget. 

Please confirm receipt of this email and forward to any necessary parties. 

Thanks, 

Alicia Griffin, CPA, CFE, CGMA 

Director of Finance 
Town of Rye 
10 Central Road 
Rye, NH 03870 
,agriffin@town.rye.nh.us 






















